Bid Number: 17-016

CITY OF RIALTO Bid Due Date: _ 8/10/2016
ABSTRACT OF BIDS

VENDOR AMERICOMP GROUP IMAGING CIS, INC. DAISY I.T. DILTEX INC.
PHONE (909) 481-1073 (909) 861-8332 (909) 989-5585 (626) 960-1314
CONTACT K. JEWELL J. KISHOR L. LOSQUADRO D. SINGH
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY BRAND: IMAGE MASTER OEM BRAND: DAISY/1YR WARR OEM

DELL YTVTC BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2355DN
001 |PRINTER 5 $79.95 $399.75 $165.50 $827.50 $59.00 $295.00 $162.20 $811.00

DELL C7D6F BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL B2375DNF
002 [PRINTER 5 $89.95 $449.75 $166.50 $832.50 $69.00 $345.00 $163.09 $815.45

DELL HX756 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2335DN
003 [PRINTER 5 $59.95 $299.75 $99.50 $497.50 $55.00 $275.00 $100.33 $501.65

DELL X5GDJ RETURN BLACK TONER
CARTRIDGE (25K YIELD) FOR A DELL

004 [B5460DN PRINTER 2 $199.95 $399.90 $289.50 $579.00 $195.00 $390.00 $283.64 $567.28
SUBTOTAL $1,549.15 $2,736.50 $1,305.00 $2,695.38
SALES TAX (8%) $123.93 $218.92 $104.40 $215.63
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL $1,673.08 $2,955.42 $1,409.40 $2,911.01




VENDOR DP INKCLONERS, LLC LD PRODUCTS, INC. OFFICE DEPOT
PHONE (310) 618-8424 (866) 274-2821 (888) 375-6648 (253) 230-1280
CONTACT K. CLAUSEN M. POMPONIO D. ATHEY M. BRYANT
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY BRAND: DPI 1 YR WARR BRAND: LD/2 YR WARR BRAND: DELL
DELL YTVTC BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2355DN
001 |PRINTER 5 $54.99 $274.95 $59.00 $295.00 $33.94 $169.70 NO BID NO BID
DELL C7D6F BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL B2375DNF
002 |PRINTER 5 $74.99 $374.95 $69.00 $345.00 $35.40 $177.00 $182.99 $914.95
DELL HX756 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2335DN
003 |PRINTER 5 $47.99 $239.95 $49.00 $245.00 $17.97 $89.85 NO BID NO BID
DELL X5GDJ RETURN BLACK TONER
CARTRIDGE (25K YIELD) FOR A DELL
004 |B5460DN PRINTER 2 $159.99 $319.98 $119.00 $238.00 $87.50 $175.00 $319.00 $638.00
SUBTOTAL $1,209.83 $1,123.00 $611.55 $1,552.95
SALES TAX (8%) $96.79 $89.84 $48.92 $124.24
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $1,306.62 $1,212.84 $660.47 $1,677.19




VENDOR OFFICE DEPOT OFFICE SOLUTIONS PEACOCK SYSTEMS SAN UNIVERSAL
PHONE (253) 230-1280 (800) 859-0128 (909) 627-7730 (404) 729-4036
CONTACT M. BRYANT B. BUNKERS K. DESAI N. SHAH
BRAND: CARTRIDGE BRAND: SAN UNIVERSAL/1 YR
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY BRAND: DELL WAREHOUSE/1 YR WARR OEM WARR
DELL YTVTC BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2355DN
001 [PRINTER 5 $131.75 $658.75 $46.72 $233.60 $168.00 $840.00 $33.50 $167.50
DELL C7D6F BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL B2375DNF
002 |PRINTER 5 NO BID NO BID $66.89 $334.45 $169.00 $845.00 $51.00 $255.00
DELL HX756 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2335DN
003 |PRINTER 5 $87.29 $436.45 $46.26 $231.30 $101.00 $505.00 $28.50 $142.50
DELL X5GDJ RETURN BLACK TONER
CARTRIDGE (25K YIELD) FOR A DELL
004 |B5460DN PRINTER 2 NO BID NO BID $163.29 $326.58 $312.00 $624.00 $81.50 $163.00
SUBTOTAL $1,095.20 $1,125.93 $2,814.00 $728.00
SALES TAX (8%) $87.62 $90.07 $225.12 $58.24
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $1,182.82 $1,216.00 $3,039.12 $786.24




VENDOR SHOPLET.COM STEVEN ENTERPRISES STEVEN ENTERPRISES THE TREE HOUSE
PHONE (212) 619-3353 (800) 491-8785 (800) 491-8785 (800) 595-6651
CONTACT H. MELENDEZ L. PEPPER L. PEPPER K. NEAL RIZZO
BRAND: EXPRESSIONS/3 YR
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY OEM OEM WARR BRAND: PCI/1 YR WARR
DELL YTVTC BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2355DN
001 [PRINTER 5 $189.00 $945.00 $192.75 $963.75 $63.35 $316.75 $67.25 $336.25
DELL C7D6F BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL B2375DNF
002 [PRINTER 5 $189.00 $945.00 $183.70 $918.50 $65.75 $328.75 $67.25 $336.25
DELL HX756 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
(10K YIELD) FOR A DELL 2335DN
003 |PRINTER 5 $123.03 $615.15 $110.90 $554.50 $38.45 $192.25 $45.15 $225.75
DELL X5GDJ RETURN BLACK TONER
CARTRIDGE (25K YIELD) FOR A DELL
004 [B5460DN PRINTER 2 $358.68 $717.36 $320.00 $640.00 $135.50 $271.00 $150.20 $300.40
SUBTOTAL $3,222.51 $3,076.75 $1,108.75 $1,198.65
SALES TAX (8%) $257.80 $246.14 $88.70 $95.89
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $3,480.31 $3,322.89 $1,197.45 $1,294.54




