
17-017

17-Aug

ITEM QTY

001 10 $2,270.00 $239.00 $2,390.00 $272.00 $2,720.00 $289.99 $2,899.90

002 10 $685.00 $70.00 $700.00 $80.00 $800.00 $79.99 $799.90

003 10 $74.99 $749.90

$0.00

$3,801.60

EVOLUTION SPORTS

DANIEL ORRELL

$4,449.70

$355.98

$0.00

$4,805.68

NO BID

$3,191.40

B&H 

(212) 238-7503

NATHAN H.

$3,090.00

$247.20

$0.00

$3,337.20

NO BID 

$68.50

$2,955.00

$236.40

$0.00

DESCRIPTION

ADORAMA INC

(212) 741-0401

ALBA C.

$227.00

CANTILEVER 30MM MOUNT, 

CM-202

AXTS AMBIDEXTROUS 

RAPTOR CHARGING HANDLE

CURTIS BLUE LINE 

CITY OF RIALTO 

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

CONTACT

PHONE

VENDOR

STRIKE EAGLE 1-6X24 AR-

BDC RIFLESCOPE, #SE-1624-

1

NO BID 

Bid Number:

Bid Due Date:

SALES TAX (8%)

SUBTOTAL

FREIGHT

TOTAL

$3,520.00

$281.60

(323) 780-0254

SCOTT M.



ITEM QTY

001 10 $362.62 $3,626.20 $245.25 $2,452.50 $269.40 $2,694.00

002 10 $97.80 $978.00 $70.40 $704.00 $77.40 $774.00

003 10 $93.90 $939.00 $90.00 $900.00

$0.00

$4,381.02

VORTEX OPTICS

(608) 826-6273

STEPHEN M.

$3,468.00

$277.44

$0.00

$3,745.44

NO BID

$0.00

$5,986.66

LCACTION POLICE 

SUPPLY

(408) 294-2677

OPTICSPLANET, INC.

(888) 504-7871

SCOTT T.

$4,056.50

$324.52

$5,543.20

$443.46

CANTILEVER 30MM MOUNT, 

CM-202

AXTS AMBIDEXTROUS 

RAPTOR CHARGING HANDLE

SUBTOTAL

SALES TAX (8%)

FREIGHT

TOTAL

VENDOR

PHONE

CONTACT

DESCRIPTION

STRIKE EAGLE 1-6X24 AR-

BDC RIFLESCOPE, #SE-1624-

1


