
ITEM QTY

001 1 $175.00 $175.00 $167.00 $167.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

002 1 $105.00 $105.00 $89.00 $89.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $147.44 $147.44

003 1 $121.00 $121.00 $109.00 $109.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

004 8 $145.00 $1,160.00 $129.00 $1,032.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$113.83

not as specd $910.64

005 1 $952.00 $952.00 $1,089.00 $1,089.00 NO BID NO BID $1,169.00 $1,169.00
$644.91

not as specd $644.91

006 1 $191.00 $191.00 $189.00 $189.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

007 1 $16.75 $16.75 $18.00 $18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

008 1 $17.80 $17.80 $25.00 $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

009 4 NO BID NO BID $39.71 $158.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

010 2 NO BID NO BID $19.160 $38.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

011 1 NO BID NO BID $258.95 $258.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

012 5 NO BID NO BID $52.460 $262.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

013 5 NO BID NO BID $59.960 $299.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

014 1 $384.00 $384.00 $369.00 $369.00 $614.38 $614.38 $435.00 $435.00 NO BID NO BID

IMPACT REVERSIBLE MUSLIN 
BACKGROUND (10X12, STONE BLUE, 
NICKEL), #BGR-1012-SB/N

CONTACT L. COLLINS

CHAUVET DMX CONTROLLER, #OBEY 
40
CHAUVET LED 4-CHANNEL DIMMER 
PACK, #DMX-4
CHAUVET DMX LED LINEAR WASH 
LIGHT, #COLORSTRIP
DJI PHANTOME 4 QUADCOPTER, 
#CP.PT.000312
FEIYU G4 3-AXISHANDHELD GIMBAL 
FOR GORPRO HERO4/3+/3, #FEGMG4
FOTODIOX QUICK RELEASE MOUNT 
WITH SCREW HOLES FOR GOPRO 
BLACK, #GT-QRHOLES-BLACK
POLOR PRO GLASS ND FILTER FOR 
GOPRO STANDARD HOUSING, 
#POP1004

PHONE

VENDOR

SEKONIC L-308S-U FLASHMATE LIGHT 
METER, #401--307

DESCRIPTION

(800) 626-5468(866) 461-9703

D. SALOVER

CISADORAMA INC.

(212) 741-0401

A. CASTILLO

PCMGCDW

IMPACT MUSLION BACKGROUND 
10X12 BLACK, #BG-B-1012

SHURE POWERED UHF ANTENNA 
DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM, #UA844SWB

RAYA 5-IN-1 COLLAPSIBLE 
REFLECTOR DISC 42", #CR-51-32
DELTA 1 MUSLIN MOVER THREE-WALL 
44" SYSTEM, #44230
IMPACT REVERSIBLE MUSLIN 
BACKGROUND (10X12, SKY 
BLUE/AQUA), #BGR-1012-SB/A

Bid Number: 17-023

Bid Due Date: 9/7/16

B&H

(909) 982-0161

A. GULATI

(909) 861-8332

J. KISHOR

CITY OF RIALTO 

ABSTRACT OF BIDS



015 1 $799.95 $799.95 $829.00 $829.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

016 1 $724.50 $724.50 $769.00 $769.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

017 1 NO BID NO BID $165.00 $165.00 $235.71 $235.71 $190.00 $190.00 $221.47 $221.47

018 1 $1,515.00 $1,515.00 $1,579.00 $1,579.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

019 2 $30.99 $61.98 $49.99 $99.98 $32.58 $65.16 $38.50 $77.00 NO BID NO BID

020 1 NO BID NO BID $25.00 $25.00 $19.84 $19.84 $23.25 $23.25 NO BID NO BID

021 2 NO BID NO BID $39.99 $79.98 $25.60 $51.20 $30.75 $61.50 NO BID NO BID

022 1 NO BID NO BID $27.00 $27.00 $26.94 $26.94 NO BID NO BID $10.91 $10.91

023 3 $9.65 $28.95 $39.95 $119.85 $45.93 $137.79 $41.25 $123.75 $43.59 $130.77

024 1 $6.70 $6.70 $19.96 $19.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

025 2 NO BID NO BID $49.00 $98.00 $39.57 $79.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

026 1 $275.00 $275.00 $284.21 $284.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.39 $22.39

027 10 $60.00 $600.00 $62.00 $620.00 NO BID NO BID $58.75 $587.50 $52.37 $523.70

028 3 $125.00 $375.00 $119.00 $357.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

029 1 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 NO BID NO BID $8.35 $8.35 NO BID NO BID

030 1 $32.00 $32.00 $38.00 $38.00 NO BID NO BID $35.35 $35.35 NO BID NO BID

SENNHEISER EW 100 ENG G3 
WIRELESS BASIC KIT (a: 516-558 MHZ), 
B & H ITEM #SEEW100EBAK

DJI UV FILTER FOR PHANTOM 4 
QUADCOPTER, #CP.PT.000372

MANFROTTO ALUMINUM TRIPOD WITH 
3-WAY PAN/TILT HEAD, #MK190XPRO4-
3W

SANDISK 128GB EXTREME PRO UHS-I 
SDXC US MEMORY CARD CLASS 10, 
#SDSDXP-128G-A46

TASCAM DR-40 4-TRACK HANDHELD 
DIGITAL AUDIO RECORDER BRONZE, 
#DR-40BR
DJI 9450S QUICK RELEASE 
PROPELLERS FOR PHANTOM 4 
QUADCOPTER, #CP.PT.000360

GOPRO DUAL BATTERY CHARGER 
FOR HERO3+/HERO3, #AHBBP-301

KENSIGNTON PREENETER EXPERT 
RED LASER WITH CURSOR CONTROL 
(BLACK), #K72425AM

VELLO V-RIG 4.1 TRIPLE SHOE 
BRACKET, #CB-415

GOPRO DIVE HOUSING FOR HERO3, 
HERO3+ AND HERO4, #AHDEH-301

PROAM USA ORION DVC210 12' 
CAMERA CRANE WEDDING 
PRODUCTION PACKAGE, #TK_WED

CISCO SG300-10 10-PORT 10/100/1000 
GIGABIT MANAGED SWITCH, 
#SRW2008-K9-NA
AUTOCUE/QTV 10" PROPTER 
PACKAGE, QSTART, CONTROLLER & 
CARRY CASE, #OCU-SSP10/PROMO
GOPRO JAWS: FLEX CLAMP, #ACMPM-
001

GOPRO JUNIOR CHESTY, #ACHMJ-301
GOPRO SUCTION CUP MOUNT, 
#AUCMT-302



031 4 $71.50 $286.00 $71.93 $287.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.59 $74.36

032 2 $70.00 $140.00 $139.00 $278.00 NO BID NO BID $153.00 $306.00 NO BID NO BID

033 4 $79.99 $319.96 $72.00 $288.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

034 20 NO BID NO BID $4.95 $99.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

035 2 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $7.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

036 2 $28.99 $57.98 $28.95 $57.90 NO BID NO BID $27.25 $54.50 $39.13 $78.26

037 2 $36.99 $73.98 $36.86 $73.72 NO BID NO BID $27.50 $55.00 $15.93 $31.86

038 9 $9.25 $83.25 $19.95 $179.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.14 $46.26

039 1 $29.49 $29.49 $29.49 $29.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.56 $28.56

040 4 NO BID NO BID $5.95 $23.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

041 2 NO BID NO BID $23.95 $47.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

042 6 NO BID NO BID $15.95 $95.70 NO BID NO BID $14.00 $84.00 NO BID NO BID

043 1 NO BID NO BID $45.00 $45.00 $46.67 $46.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

044 1 NO BID NO BID $29.00 $29.00 $29.77 $29.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

045 1 NO BID NO BID $279.00 $279.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

046 5 $18.91 $94.55 $18.91 $94.55 NO BID NO BID $20.50 $102.50 $17.61 $88.05

047 4 $28.05 $112.20 $28.50 $114.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ULTIMATE SUPPORT TS-90B 
ALUMINUM SPEAKER STAND MATTE 
BLACK, #13908
DJI INTELLIGENT FLIGHT BATTERY 
FOR PHANTOM 4 QUADCOPTER, 
#CP.PT.000399
HOSA TECHNOLOGY SKT-200 SERIES 
SPEAKON SPEAKER CABLE 12 GAUGE 
100', MFR #SKT-2100

ALTMAN 17" SAFETY CABLE, #MAC-SC

DEVEK GAFFER TAPE 1/2" X 25 YD, 
NEON GREEN, #GT-FGRN0.5/25
TRENDNET TEW-805UB AC1200 DUAL 
BAND WIRELESS USB 3.0 ADAPTER, 
#TEW-805UB
AMERICAN DJ ACCU-CABLE 3-PIN DMX 
CABLE 100', #AC3PDMX100
PIG HOG 3PIN XLR DMX CABLE 10', 
#PHDMX10SANDISK 64GB EXTREME UHS I 
MICROSKXC MEMORY CARD 
U3/CLASS 10, #SDSQXNE-064G-
GN6MA
PROTAPES PRO GAFFER TAPE 2" X 12 
YD, BLACK, #001UPCG212MBLA1
AURAY PREMIUM MIC FLAG SQUARE 
BLACK, #PMF-SB
DLINK DUB-H4 HI-SPEED USB 2.0 
(480MBPS) 4-PORT HUB-WIN/MAC, 
#DUB-H4

APPLE LIGHTNING DIDGITAL AV 
ADAPTER WHITE, #MD826AM/A
APPLE MINI DISPLAY PORT TO VGA 
DISPLAY ADAPTER, #MB572Z/B
ECLIPSE TOOLS PRO ELECTRONICS 
TOOL KIT, #1PK-1900NA
MAGLIGHT MINI PRO 2AA LED 
FLASHLIGHT WITH HOLSTER V.2 
BLACK, #SP2P01H
MATTHEWS SADDLE SANDBAG 20LBS, 
#299700



048 10 NO BID NO BID $2.36 $23.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

049 6 NO BID NO BID $4.76 $28.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

050 1 NO BID NO BID $55.00 $55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

051 1 $17.99 $17.99 $23.32 $23.32 NO BID NO BID $21.50 $21.50 NO BID NO BID

052 4 $34.36 $137.44 $34.36 $137.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

053 4 NO BID NO BID $23.99 $95.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.93 $63.72

054 2 NO BID NO BID $19.99 $39.98 $12.87 $25.74 $15.45 $30.90 NO BID NO BID

055 2 NO BID NO BID $19.99 $39.98 $14.11 $28.22 $15.45 $30.90 $4.11 $8.22

056 1 $55.70 $55.70 $49.99 $49.99 NO BID NO BID $50.25 $50.25 $15.39 $15.39

057 2 NO BID NO BID $39.99 $79.98 $26.94 $53.88 $30.75 $61.50 NO BID NO BID

058 4 $9.95 $39.80 $4.89 $19.56 NO BID NO BID $3.30 $13.20 NO BID NO BID

059 2 NO BID NO BID $14.99 $29.98 $10.27 $20.54 $11.55 $23.10 NO BID NO BID

AURAY FOAM WINDSCREEN FOR 1-
5/8" DIAMETER MICROPHONES BLACK, 
#WHF-158
AURAY FOAM WINDSCREEN FOR 1" 
DIAMETER MICROPHONES BLACK, 
#WHF-2545
PEARSTONE ARTICULATING ARM AND 
MINI CLAMP KIT, #AA-83K
PYLE PRO PCT-10 8-IN-1 AUDIO CABLE 
TESTER, #PCT10
HOSA TECHNOLOGY BALANCED 1/4 
TRS MALE TO 1/4 TRS MALE AUDIO 
CABLE 100', #HSS-100
KOPUL PREMIUM PERFORMANCE 
3000 SERIES XLR M TO XLR F 
MICROPHONE CABLE, #M3100

GOPRO 3.5 MM MIC ADAPTER FOR 
HERO3/ HERO3+/ HERO4, #AMCCC-301

GOPRO HDMI CABLE FOR HERO 
6'/1.8M, #AHDMC-301
GOPRO DUAL BATTERY CHARGER 
WITH BATTERY FOR HERO4, #AHBBP-
401

GOPRO THE FRAME FOR 
HERO3/HERO3+/HERO4, #ANDFR-302

NEUTRIK LOCKABLE SPEAKON 
COUPLER, #NL4MMX

GOPRO HELMET STARP MOUNT, 
#GVHS30

SUBTOTAL

SALES TAX (8%)

FREIGHT

TOTAL

$8,998.97 $3,046.91

$9,718.89 $3,290.66

$719.92 $243.75

$0.00 $0.00

$3,544.05

$283.52

$37.00

$3,864.57$12,828.10

$1,434.98

$114.80

$0.00

$1,549.78

$11,877.87

$950.23

$0.00


