
Bid Number:

Bid Due Date:

Advertised:

Vendors Solicitated:

ITEM QTY UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

001 5 $1,485.00 $7,425.00 $1,878.05 $9,390.25 $1,479.00 $7,395.00 $1,517.00 $7,585.00

002 5 $140.25 $701.25 $175.25 $876.25 $141.95 $709.75 $142.00 $710.00

003 5 $155.00 $775.00 $194.10 $970.50 $159.00 $795.00 $156.00 $780.00

004 2 $351.50 $703.00 $413.75 $827.50 $349.00 $698.00 $349.00 $698.00

005 5 $151.50 $757.50 $169.95 $849.75 $128.00 $640.00 $141.00 $705.00

006 5 $22.50 $112.50 $31.45 $157.25 $23.00 $115.00 $24.00 $120.00

007 10 $163.75 $1,637.50 $208.70 $2,087.00 $165.90 $1,659.00 $153.00 $1,530.00

008 10 $60.25 $602.50 $68.25 $682.50 $63.16 $631.60 $60.00 $600.00

009 5 $4,195.00 $20,975.00 $4,141.45 $20,707.25 $4,195.00 $20,975.00 $4,195.00 $20,975.00

010 5 $74.50 $372.50 $202.45 $1,012.25 $144.00 $720.00 $185.00 $925.00

011 5 $26.75 $133.75 $42.00 $210.00 $35.00 $175.00 $38.00 $190.00

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

CITY OF RIALTO 

(800) 947-8003

CARROLLTON, TX NEW YORK, NY

CONTACT

PORTA BRACE RS-DVX200 RAIN SLICKER FOR 
PANASONIC DVX200 CAMERA, #PORSDVX200

DOLGIN ENGINEERING TC200-i-TDM TWO POSITION 
SIMULTANEOUS BATTERY CHARGER FOR PANASONIC, 
#DOTC200PATDM

PORTA BRACE CUSTOM CARRYING CASE FOR 
PANASONIC AG-DVX200 CAMERA, #POCARDVX200

ADORAMA

(212) 741-0401

NEW YORK, NY

MILLER DS-20 ALUMINUM TRIOD SYSTEM, #MIDS20EOGK

AZTEK COMPUTERS B & H

(469) 574-0240

albac@adorama.com sanjay@aztekcomputers.com govedbids@bhphotovideo.com

VENDOR

LIBEC EXTENION ZOOM CABLE FOR 2.5 MM LANC, 
#LIEX530DV

LIBEC REMOTE ZOOM AND FOCUS CONTROL FOR 
SELECT LANC & PANASONIC CAMERAS, #LIZFC5HD

DESCRIPTION

PHONE

LOCATION

PANASONIC 7.28V 43WH BATTERY FOR DVX200 
(5,900mAh), #PAAGVBR59P
SANDISK 128GB EXTREME PRO UHS-1 SDXC U3 MEMORY 
CARD (CLASS 10)
PANASONIC AG-DVX200 4K HANDHELD CAMCORDER 
W/ITH 4/3'S SENSOR, #PAAGDVX200
GENARAY LED-7100T 312 LED VARIABLE COLOR 
ONCAMERA LIGHT, #GELEDP312T

AIRBOX MACRO VELVET SOFTBOX (8X11X6), #AIMV

CALIFORNIA MEDIA SOL

(707) 746-8273

BENICIA, CA

detroy@calmediasolutions.com

17-033

10/6/2016

9/18/2016

68



012 5 $19.50 $97.50 $36.75 $183.75 $14.00 $70.00 $33.00 $165.00

013 5 $15.75 $78.75 $29.94 $149.70 $26.90 $134.50 $28.00 $140.00

014 2 $40.75 $81.50 $73.50 $147.00 $47.50 $95.00 $68.00 $136.00

015 3 $12.00 $36.00 $18.85 $56.55 $15.00 $45.00 $13.00 $39.00

016 3 $130.00 $390.00 $150.05 $450.15 $120.95 $362.85 $122.00 $366.00

017 2 $569.41 $1,138.82 $970.00 $1,940.00 $699.99 $1,399.98 $846.00 $1,692.00

018 5 $133.00 $665.00 $55.38 $276.90 FREE FREE $125.00 $625.00

019 5 $35.95 $179.75 $42.00 $210.00 FREE FREE $35.00 $175.00

020 5 $230.00 $1,150.00 $352.50 $1,762.50 $269.95 $1,349.75 $274.00 $1,370.00
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WATSON NP-F550 LITHIUM -ION BATTERY PACK 
#WANPF550

ZEISS LENS CLEANING KIT

HOYA 72MM DIGITAL FILTER KIT II, #HODFK272
HOYA 72MM ULTAVIOLET UV HAZE MULTICOATED 
FILTER, #HOUVMC72
MILLER 489 CAMERA MOUNTING PLATE WITH 1/4"-20 AND 
3/8"-16 SCREWS FOR DS-20, #MI489
SENNHEISER EW 100 ENG G3 WIRELESS BASIC KIT, 
#SEEW100EBAK
iZOTOPE RX PLUG-IN PACK-AUDIO REPAIR PLUG-IN 
BUNDLE ACCESSORIES
AURAY DUSM-1 UNIVERSAL SHOCK MOUNT FOR CAMERA 
SHOES AND BOOMPOLES ACCSSORIES
SENNHEISER MKE 600 - SHOTGUM MICROPHONE 
#SEMKE600

SALES TAX (8%)

$42,947.05 $37,970.43

$3,041.03

SUBTOTAL $38,012.82

$0.00

$3,435.76 $3,037.63

$2,748.00 $0.00

TOTAL $41,053.85 $49,130.81 $41,008.06

FREIGHT

$39,526.00

$42,688.08

$3,162.08

$0.00



ITEM QTY UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

001 5 $1,610.00 $8,050.00 $1,640.00 $8,200.00 $1,629.00 $8,145.00

002 5 $169.00 $845.00 $159.00 $795.00 $159.00 $795.00

003 5 $170.00 $850.00 $171.00 $855.00 $175.00 $875.00

004 2 $375.00 $750.00 $285.00 $570.00 $369.00 $738.00

005 5 $140.00 $700.00 $145.00 $725.00 $155.00 $775.00

006 5 $30.00 $150.00 $26.50 $132.50 $27.00 $135.00

007 10 $180.00 $1,800.00 $179.00 $1,790.00 $185.00 $1,850.00

008 10 $70.00 $700.00 $64.25 $642.50 $64.00 $640.00

009 5 $4,210.00 $21,050.00 $4,205.00 $21,025.00 $3,599.00 $17,995.00

010 5 $150.00 $750.00 $164.00 $820.00 $188.00 $940.00

011 5 $40.00 $200.00 $37.50 $187.50 $39.00 $195.00

012 5 $32.00 $160.00 $32.90 $164.50 $34.00 $170.00

013 5 $30.00 $150.00 $28.00 $140.00 $28.00 $140.00
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VENDOR FUTURE COMPUTER SOL SINA'S CUSTOM LAB WOODGATE SALES

YORBA LINDA, CA TARZANA, CA LONG BRANCH, NJ

CONTACT spatel@fcsinc.com sina@orientalphotousa.com leonelh@woodgatesales.com

DESCRIPTION

PHONE (714) 692-9120 (310) 308-2484 (732) 357-2439

LOCATION

MILLER DS-20 ALUMINUM TRIOD SYSTEM, #MIDS20EOGK

PORTA BRACE RS-DVX200 RAIN SLICKER FOR PANASONIC 
DVX200 CAMERA, #PORSDVX200

PORTA BRACE CUSTOM CARRYING CASE FOR PANASONIC AG-
DVX200 CAMERA, #POCARDVX200

DOLGIN ENGINEERING TC200-i-TDM TWO POSITION 
SIMULTANEOUS BATTERY CHARGER FOR PANASONIC, 
#DOTC200PATDM

LIBEC REMOTE ZOOM AND FOCUS CONTROL FOR SELECT 
LANC AND PANASONIC CAMERAS, #LIZFC5HD

LIBEC EXTENION ZOOM CABLE FOR 2.5 MM LANC, #LIEX530DV

PANASONIC 7.28V 43WH BATTERY FOR DVX200 (5,900mAh), 
#PAAGVBR59P

SANDISK 128GB EXTREME PRO UHS-1 SDXC U3 MEMORY CARD 
(CLASS 10)

PANASONIC AG-DVX200 4K HANDHELD CAMCORDER WITH 
FOUR THIRDS SENSOR, #PAAGDVX200

GENARAY LED-7100T 312 LED VARIABLE COLOR ONCAMERA 
LIGHT, #GELEDP312T

AIRBOX MACRO VELVET SOFTBOX (8X11X6), #AIMV

WATSON NP-F550 LITHIUM -ION BATTERY PACK #WANPF550

ZEISS LENS CLEANING KIT



014 2 $65.00 $130.00 $64.00 $128.00 $68.00 $136.00

015 3 $20.00 $60.00 $17.50 $52.50 $16.00 $48.00

016 3 $140.00 $420.00 $140.00 $420.00 $135.00 $405.00

017 2 $710.00 $1,420.00 $788.00 $1,576.00 $869.00 $1,738.00

018 5 NO BID NO BID $69.00 $345.00 $128.00 $640.00

019 5 NO BID NO BID $29.00 $145.00 $39.00 $195.00

020 5 $279.00 $1,395.00 $309.00 $1,545.00 $289.00 $1,445.00
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HOYA 72MM DIGITAL FILTER KIT II, #HODFK272

HOYA 72MM ULTAVIOLET UV HAZE MULTICOATED FILTER, 
#HOUVMC72

MILLER 489 CAMERA MOUNTING PLATE WITH 1/4"-20 AND 3/8"-
16 SCREWS FOR DS-20, #MI489

SENNHEISER EW 100 ENG G3 WIRELESS BASIC KIT, 
#SEEW100EBAK

iZOTOPE RX PLUG-IN PACK-AUDIO REPAIR PLUG-IN BUNDLE 
ACCESSORIES

SALES TAX (8%) $3,166.40 $3,220.68 $3,040.00

AURAY DUSM-1 UNIVERSAL SHOCK MOUNT FOR CAMERA 
SHOES AND BOOMPOLES ACCSSORIES

SENNHEISER MKE 600 - SHOTGUM MICROPHONE #SEMKE600

SUBTOTAL $39,580.00 $40,258.50 $38,000.00

FREIGHT $100.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL $42,846.40 $43,479.18 $41,040.00


