
17-040

10/10/16

ITEM QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

001 10 4.87$     48.70$     9.96$     99.60$     8.87$     88.70$     8.45$     84.50$     5.75$     57.50$     8.85$     88.50$     

002 10 4.87$     48.70$     9.96$     99.60$     8.87$     88.70$     8.45$     84.50$     5.75$     57.50$     8.85$     88.50$     

003 10  $    6.73 67.30$     9.96$     99.60$      $  11.16 111.60$    $  10.45 104.50$    $    7.75 77.50$      $  11.55 115.50$   

004 5  $  15.79 78.95$     9.96$     49.80$      NO BID NO BID  $  10.45 52.25$      $    8.75 43.75$      $  11.55 57.75$     

005 20  $    8.39 167.80$   9.96$     199.20$    $  12.97 259.40$    $  11.45 229.00$    $    9.75 195.00$    $  13.55 271.00$   

006 10  $    8.27  $     82.70  $  10.80  $   108.00  $    9.82  $     98.20  $    9.65  $     96.50 7.50$     75.00$     11.15$   111.50$   

007 5  $  16.77  $     83.85  $  10.80  $     54.00  NO BID  NO BID  $    9.65  $     48.25 9.50$     47.50$     11.15$   55.75$     

008 10  $    9.53  $     95.30  $  10.80  $   108.00  $  11.62  $   116.20  $  11.65  $   116.50  $    9.50 95.00$      $  12.65 126.50$   

009 5 10.73$    $     53.65  $  10.80  $     54.00 12.98$    $     64.90  $  12.65  $     63.25  $  11.50 57.50$      $  13.40 67.00$     

010 5 15.77$    $     78.85  $  10.80  $     54.00 NO BID  NO BID  $  12.65  $     63.25  $  14.50 72.50$      $  13.40 67.00$     

011 15  $    4.87  $     73.05  $    9.96  $   149.40  $    8.87  $   133.05  $    8.45  $   126.75 5.75$     86.25$     8.85$     132.75$   

012 20  $    6.73  $   134.60  $    9.96  $   199.20  $  11.16  $   223.20  $  10.45  $   209.00 7.75$     155.00$   11.55$   231.00$   

013 10 8.39$      $     83.90  $    9.96  $     99.60 12.97$    $   129.70 11.45$    $   114.50  $    8.75 87.50$      $  13.55 135.50$   

014 5 9.73$      $     48.65  $    9.96  $     49.80 NO BID  NO BID 12.45$   62.25$      $    9.75 48.75$      $  13.55 67.75$     

 $     35.00 

1,559.54$                 

Maril C. Karen H. Ruben D. 

1,348.65$                 

SIZE: X-LARGE

SIZE: XX-LARGE

SIZE: XXX-LARGE

SIZE: XX-LARGE

SIZE: XXX-LARGE

(714) 895-1447

Computerized 
Embroidery Co.

103.00$                    

CITY OF RIALTO 
ABSTRACT OF BIDS

1,423.80$                 1,455.00$                 

Tax (8.0%)

CONTACT David T.

Ad-Wear & Specialty 
of Texas

(713) 953-9893

1,571.40$                 

1,146.00$                 

1,237.68$                 1,537.70$                 

107.89$                    

Authentic Promotions

(800) 497-7765

California Marketing

DESCRIPTION

Bid Number:

SIZE: X-LARGE

(909) 825-3841

Bid Due Date:

VENDOR

PHONE

SIZE: XX-LARGE LONG

116.40$                    

-$                          

91.68$                      113.90$                    

SIZE: XXX-LARGE

-$                          

Subtotal

-$                          

ORANGE HANES BEEFY-T W/POCKET, SHORT SLEEVE WITH WHITE SCREEN PRINTED SEAL ABOVE POCKET

SIZE: LARGE

SIZE: X-LARGE

SIZE: XXXX-LARGE

Total

Shipping

SIZE: XX-LARGE

Eagle Groups 

(812) 378-4272

Todd B.

Urimage

(909) 820-5076

Mike L. 

70.00$                      

1,318.75$                 

129.28$                    

1,745.28$                 

 $                1,156.25  $                1,616.00 

SET UP FEE

NAVY HANES BEEFY-T W/POCKET, SHORT SLEEVE WITH WHITE SCREEN PRINTED SEAL ABOVE POCKET

ORANGE HANES BEEFY-T W/POCKET, LONG SLEEVE WITH WHITE SCREEN PRINTED SEAL ABOVE POCKET

92.50$                      

SIZE: X-LARGE LONG

SIZE: XXX-LARGE LONG



 LINE ITEMS 004, 007, 
AND 010 ARE NOT 

LONG 

ALTERNATE/EXCEPTIONS:  ITEM 010: PORT 
AUTHORITY ITEM 

#PC61LST 

 ITEM 007, 010, 014: 
BIDDING ALTERNATE 

GILDAN 2300 & 2410

 ITEMS 004, 007, AND 
010 ARE NOT LONG


