CITY OF RIALTO

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

Bid Number: 17-065

Bid Due Date: 12/20/2016

ALL STATE POLICE

VENDOR EQUIPMENT BOB BARKER COMPANY BOTACH BUSINESS SERVICES
PHONE (909) 595-2470 (800) 334-9880 (213) 595-6492 (619) 366-1794
CONTACT J. TERRELL R. PRETKO A. SARBAH T. BRUNNING
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY
2800 MONADNOCK WOODEN
001 |BATON BLACK 36" 100 | $18.40 $1,840.00 $23.34 $2,334.00 $17.82 $1,782.00 $23.98 $2,398.00
GROMETT FOR 2800 MONADNOCK
002 [WOOD BATON 120 $4.00 $480.00 $4.49 $538.80 NO BID NO BID $6.69 $802.80
BASKET WEAVE LEATHER BATON
RING WITH NICKEL SNAPS FOR
003 |MONADNOCK 2800 60 $6.85 $411.00 $9.96 $597.60 NO BID NO BID $7.89 $473.40
NYLON BATON RING WITH NICKEL
004 [SNAPS FOR MONADNOCK 2800 | 60 $6.85 $411.00 $9.96 $597.60 NO BID NO BID $7.89 $473.40
SUBTOTAL $3,142.00 $4,068.00 $1,782.00 $4,147.60
SALES TAX (8%) $251.36 $325.44 $142.56 $331.81
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $3,393.36 $4,393.44 $1,924.56 $4,479.41




LC ACTION POLICE

VENDOR COPS PLUS DONOCH MOTORS GALLS SUPPLY
PHONE (800) 330-6422 (240) 435-8775 (562) 304-7805 (408) 294-2677
CONTACT M. ELNEWISHY R. ONOCHIE J. CAMPBELL S. MOORE
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY
2800 MONADNOCK WOODEN
001 |BATON BLACK 36" 100 | $21.67 $2,167.00 $28.39 $2,839.00 $20.77 $2,077.00 $19.05 $1,905.00
GROMETT FOR 2800 MONADNOCK
002 [WOOD BATON 120 $4.42 $530.40 $6.49 $778.80 $3.99 $478.80 $3.88 $465.60
BASKET WEAVE LEATHER BATON
RING WITH NICKEL SNAPS FOR
003 |MONADNOCK 2800 60 $6.07 $364.20 $8.29 $497.40 $5.00 $300.00 $5.41 $324.60
NYLON BATON RING WITH NICKEL
004 [SNAPS FOR MONADNOCK 2800 | 60 $6.07 $364.20 $9.19 $551.40 $5.00 $300.00 $5.41 $324.60
SUBTOTAL $3,425.80 $4,666.60 $3,155.80 $3,019.80
SALES TAX (8%) $274.06 $373.33 $252.46 $241.58
FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $3,699.86 $5,039.93 $3,408.26 $3,261.38




NATIONAL POLICE

PROFORCE LAW

VENDOR SUPPLY P&P UNIFORMS ENFORCEMENT
PHONE (760) 599-4410 (951) 776-0048 (928) 776-7192
CONTACT SEAN C. SMITH B. MELSHEED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY
2800 MONADNOCK WOODEN
001 [BATON BLACK 36" 100 $21.00 $2,100.00 $21.68 $2,168.00 $17.80 $1,780.00
GROMETT FOR 2800 MONADNOCK
002 |WOOD BATON 120 $5.00 $600.00 $4.17 $500.40 $3.63 $435.60
BASKET WEAVE LEATHER BATON
RING WITH NICKEL SNAPS FOR
003 |MONADNOCK 2800 60 $9.00 $540.00 $5.05 $303.00 $5.09 $305.40
NYLON BATON RING WITH NICKEL
004 [SNAPS FOR MONADNOCK 2800 60 $8.00 $480.00 $5.83 $349.80 $6.32 $379.20
SUBTOTAL $3,720.00 $3,321.20 $2,900.20
SALES TAX (8%) $297.60 $265.70 $232.02
FREIGHT $50.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $4,067.60 $3,586.90 $3,132.22




